
SJS 2012 AFTER SCHOOL CLUBS 
 

** Mark your calendar for February 28th - March 22nd ** 
 

WHO:  The majority of clubs are open to K - 6th grade students and run for one hour, 
once a week, over 4 consecutive weeks.  CPR/Babysitting club and the Video club 
are open to 6th - 8th graders.  (These two clubs run 45 minutes and for 5 weeks.) 
Students in the 6th - 7th grades can earn Christian Community Service hours for 
Confirmation by volunteering to help run the lower grade clubs. 
 
WHAT:  Choose from a variety of clubs such as Lego, Puzzle, Ceramics, Yoga, 
CPR/Babysitting, Video, Dance, Crafts, and Friendship Bracelets.  The complete 
final list of the clubs will be posted on the SJS website by February 1st.  Check your 
WIN folder. We welcome your suggestions for new clubs.  The cost is approximately 
$40 per club. New this year: checks will be made payable to ‘St James School’. 
 
WHEN:  The clubs will run for 4 consecutive weeks 2/28/12 to 3/22/12.  Each club 
is held on either Tuesdays or Thursdays.  (Note: since there is a 12:05 dismissal on 
Thursday March 8th, clubs will be held on Wednesday March 7th instead.)  Each 
session runs from 2:30 to 3:30pm.  Parents will pick up their children at 3:40pm in 
the front of the school.  EDP children will return to their EDP classroom at 3:30pm. 
 
WHERE:  All clubs are held on the school premises in a designated classroom 
(except Ceramics which is at ‘Time to Kiln’ on Broad St.)  Participants will go to the 
gym at dismissal. Parents must send in a change-of-dismissal note for each session. 
 
HOW:  The sign-up forms must be printed off the SJS website. There is no online 
registration this year.  Complete one form per child and return it with payment to the 
business office.  Many clubs fill up within the first 3 days so return your forms as 
soon as possible but no later than the deadline of Wednesday, February 15th.   
 

** We really need parent volunteers (earn PFE points!) ** 
 
The clubs can’t run without enough volunteers!  This a great opportunity to earn 
points as well as have fun with your kids.  We need parents particularly from the 
lower grades.  You can bring younger siblings, and you don’t have to commit to all 4 
weeks; even 1 day is fine.   Contact: Liz Rogers erogers14@optonline.net  or 
Lindsay Horowitz lindsay@lindsaymann.com  
 

** Club registration coming soon!  Check your WIN folder ** 
 


